
    

   

   

   

                                  

 

THIRD GRADE 

Draw as many shapes as 
you can with four sides. 
Label as many as you 
know by name 

 

Visit a local park and 
skip count by 2 while 
you swing. Can you get 
to 100? 
2, 4, 6, 8… 
 

Write a story about your 
favorite animal and then 
read your story to 
someone you know.  

Visit the Olathe Library 
and get a free library 
card!  Check out some 
great books! (Be sure to 
return them 
to the library 
by the due 
date) 

Do jumping jacks while 
skip counting by 5. How 
high can you count by 
5s?  Can you get to 200? 
5, 10, 15, 20, ... 

Draw a map of the inside 
of where you live. Label 
things such as rooms 
and items in each room.  
Bonus: Hide something 
and mark it with an X on 
your map. See if 
someone can find it. 

Create 5 or more of your 

own word problems. See 

example. 

On the table, there are 4 

plates, 4 apples, 2 cups, 

and 3 candles. How 

many items are on the 

table? 

Go outside and read 
under a tree for 15 
minutes. 
Enjoy the 
sunshine. 

 

Create your own comic 
or graphic novel and 
share it with someone 
you know!   

Build a fort or hide 
under a blanket and 
read with a flashlight for 
15 minutes. 

Read to an adult, a pet 
or favorite stuffed 
animal for 15 minutes! 
 

Write about a time 
when you 
felt happy 
and explain 
what made 
you happy. Read it to 
someone you know. 
 

Create your own 
superhero. Draw a 
picture of the hero and 
write a short story about 
them.  
 

Go outside and write a 
descriptive paragraph 
about what you hear, 
see, feel, and smell. 

 

Touch your toes while 
skip counting by 10. 
10, 20, 30,… 
See if you can get to 
500! 



Talk to an adult about 
what life was like for 
them when they were 
your age. Write down 
questions you’d like to 
ask and then write their 
answers as you 
interview them. See if 
you can interview 
several people! 

Write about how you 
brush your 
teeth using 
sequencing 
words like 

first, next, then and 
finally.  
 

Ask an adult to help you 
gather coins. Sort all the 
pennies, nickels, dimes 
and quarters. Then pick 
up some coins and count 
how much money you 
have. Try this 3 times, 
each time picking up 
different combinations 
to count. 

Find a starting point in 
your yard and jump as 
far as you can. Use a 
ruler or yard stick to 
measure how far you 
jumped in inches or feet. 
Repeat this 5 times. Add 
up your measurements 
to see how far you 
jumped in all. 

Do at least three acts of 
kindness today. Make a 
list of the things you did 
to be kind and share it 
with someone. 

 

Make your own 
performance based on a 

book! 
Read or 
listen to a 
story. 
Then 
gather 

objects and try to act 
out the story. 

Write down your  
address and phone 
number. Practice 
memorizing both. 
 

Go outside on a day with 
big clouds in the sky. 
Watch the sky for 15 
minutes and see how 
many clouds you can 
count.   

 

Find 2 dice. Roll the dice 
10 times and add up the 
numbers each time. 
Then roll 10 more times, 
subtracting the two 
numbers. You could also 
find a partner and play 
this as a game, seeing 
who ends up with more 
points. 

Do squats while you skip 
count by 100. See if you 
can get to 1,000!  
100, 200, 300... 

 

Use the QR code below 
to watch a fun art 
activity on how to create 
a flower collage OR find 
a comfy spot in your 
house or yard and draw 
a picture of what you 
see. 
 

 

Use the QR code below 
to watch a fun activity 
about Word Ladders OR 
look for words around 
your home and finger 
stretch them. 

 
 
 

 

Use the QR code below 
to access books you can 
listen to OR go to the 
local library and check 
out books you can read 
or someone can read to 
you. 
 

 

 

Use the QR code below 
to hear a story about 
being responsible OR 
make a list of ways you 
can be responsible at 
home or school. Share it 
with someone you 
know. 
 

 

Use the QR code below 
to visit the Starfall 
website for books to 
read OR read a book you 
have at home. 
 

 
 

 

3rd grade page 2 


